
 

 

Boral Cement Wauchope – POELA Act 2011 Monitoring Data 

Environment Protection Licence No. 1503 

Background 

Noise monitoring is undertaken at Wauchope Cement in accordance with Condition M4 of the Wauchope Cement 
Environment Protection Licence (EPL) No. 1503 which states: 

 

 

Noise monitoring is undertaken to demonstrate the sites compliance to the Noise limits specified in the EPL which 
are specified in Condition L4 of the Wauchope Cement EPL 1503 which states: 
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Noise Monitoring Results 

2024 Noise Assessment 

Muller Acoustic Consulting Pty Ltd (MAC) has completed a Noise Monitoring Assessment (NMA) on behalf of 
Boral Cement Limited at Boral Cement Wauchope, Wauchope, NSW. The assessment was completed to 
determine the depot compliance with relevant criteria outlined in the site’s Environmental Protection Licence at 
relevant surrounding residential receivers for the annual return for the 2024 EPL period. 

Attended noise measurements were undertaken on Wednesday 16 October 2024 at one EPL monitoring 
locations and two alternate monitoring locations with depot noise contributions compared against the relevant 
criteria. The assessment has identified that noise emissions generated by Boral Cement Wauchope complied 
with relevant noise criteria specified in the Environmental Protection Licence at all assessed residential receivers.  
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2023 Noise Assessment 

The 2023 Noise Monitoring Report by Muller Acoustic Consulting was finalised on 10 November 2023. Attended 
noise measurements were undertaken on Wednesday 1 November 2023 at the one EPL location and two 
alternative locations with depot noise contributions compared against the relevant criteria. The assessment 
identified that noise emissions generated by the Boral Cement Wauchope site complied with the relevant noise 
criteria in the EPL at all assessed residential receivers. 

2022 Noise Assessment 

The 2022 Noise Monitoring Report by Muller Acoustic Consulting was finalised on 31 October 2022. Attended 
noise measurements were undertaken on Wednesday 19 October 2022 at the one EPL location and two 
alternative locations with depot noise contributions compared against the relevant criteria. The assessment 
identified that noise emissions generated by the Boral Cement Wauchope site complied with the relevant noise 
criteria in the EPL at all assessed residential receivers. 

2021 Noise Assessment 

The second Annual Noise Monitoring Report by Muller Acoustic Consulting was finalised on 29 November 2021. 
Attended noise measurements were undertaken on Wednesday 17 November 2021 at the one EPL location and 
two alternative locations with depot noise contributions compared against the relevant criteria. The assessment 
identified that noise emissions generated by the Boral Cement Wauchope site complied with the relevant noise 
criteria in the EPL at all assessed residential receivers. 

2020 Noise Assessment 

The first Annual Noise Monitoring Report by Muller Acoustic Consulting was finalised on 5 November 2020. 
Attended noise measurements were undertaken on Wednesday 30 September 2020 at the one EPL location and 
two alternative locations with depot noise contributions compared against the relevant criteria. The assessment 
identified that noise emissions generated by the Boral Cement Wauchope site complied with the relevant noise 
criteria in the EPL at all assessed residential receivers. 

 

Copies of any of the Noise Monitoring Assessment Reports prepared by Muller Acoustic Consulting are available 
on request 
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